BID ABSTRACT
Prattville Shell Repairs and Interior Finishes
Prattville, ALABAMA
IFB # AC-15-B-0017-S

17-Sep-15
General Contractor Bid Item A Bid Item B Bid Item B - Alternate 1 Bid Item B - Alternate 2
BCS, LLC $ 298,519.00 | $ 401,698.00 | $ 32,428.00 | $ 10,370.00
Central Contracting $ 259,709.00 | $ 375,590.00 | $ 9,910.00 | $ . 9,613.00
Clement Contracting NO BID
CRL-Lovelady Construction $ 259,000.00 | $ 394,000.00 | $ 24,700.00 | $ 9,200.00
. . ; -

Diversified General Contractors NO BID
Hale Building Company $ 423,497.00 | $ 376,270.00 | $ 30,336.00 | $ 9,623.00
J. F. Morgan General Contractor, Inc. NO BID

ing Company, Inc. NO BID
RDT Enterprises, LLC $ 250,000.00 | $ 370,000.00 | $ 22,275.00 | $ 8,500.00
Webb Builders, Inc. NO BID
Yeargan Construction NO BID
Dre'Co $ 298,850.00 | $ 345,599.00 | $ 15,565.00 | $ 23,102.00
| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED AND | CERTIFY THAT | HAVE THIS DATE
READ ALL OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT | HAVE WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE ABOVE
VERIFIED THE ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT CORRECT. BIDS.

— WAl (heod Astgorn

MARK A. WEEKS, muﬂo September 17, 2015 Cheryl Godfrey” September 17,2015 °




