BID ABSTRACT.

Montgomery (Ft. Wallace) Interior Finishes
Montgomery, ALABAMA

IFB # AC-15-B-0023-S

10-Sep-15
General Contractor Base Bid Alternate #1 Alternate #2 Alternate #3 Alternate #4 Alternate #5
BCS, LLC 186,420.00 116,987.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 19,236.00 16,200.00 | $ 17,690.40
Central Contracting 266,090.00 55,900.00 | $ 6,345.00 | $ 35,500.00 15,300.00 | $ 61,000.00
CW Smith Decorating Co LLC NO BID
Dixie Acoustical NO BID
Hale Building Company 372,918.00 34,872.00 | $ 13,868.00 | $ 27,868.00 18,174.00 | $ 43,127.00
Johns and Kirksey, Inc. 298,000.00 105,000.00 | $ 20,280.00 | $ 36,920.00 18,850.00 | $ 65,200.00
Liberty Design & Construction NO BID
Pemberton, Inc. NO BID
RDT Enterprises, LLC 565,000.00 35,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 20,000.00 | $ 40,000.00
Safford Building Company NO BID
Yeargan Construction 137,855.00 96,838.00 | $ 9,954.00 | $ 17,805.00 14,592.00 | $ 30,501.00

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED AND
READ ALL OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT | HAVE
VERIFIED THE ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT CORRECT.

MARK A. Eﬁmxw_ SPDO

September 10, 2015

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE THIS DATE
WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE ABOVE
BIDS.

Q/P(. M/ inun.mﬁ,c,rr J\)

Cheryl Godfrey\)  September 1042015




