BID ABSTRACT

Pelham Range Fire Break & Perimeter Maintenance

Alexandria, ALABAMA
1FB # AC-15-B-0034-S
17-Sep-15
General Contractor Base Bid Alternate #1 Alternate #2 Alternate #3 Alternate #4 Alternate #5 Alternate #6 Alternate #7 Alternate #8 Alternate #9

Cahaba Disaster Recovery NO BID
Earth Services $ 70,000.00 | $ 11,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 39,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 12,000.00 | $ 22,000.00 | $ 6,500.00 | $ 6,500.00 | $ 56,000.00
Hale Building Company, Inc. $ 149,867.00 | $ 42,046.00 | $ 9,978.00 | $ 107,067.00 | 6,367.00 25,788.00 | $ 41,197.00 | $ 23,648.00 | § 18,660.00 | $ 95,644.00
Hurst Construction, LLC NO BID
J. F. Morgan General Contractor, Inc. NO BID
Lambert Contracting, LLC BID REJECTED
RDT Enterprises, LLC NO BID

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED AND READ ALL
OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT | HAVE VERIFIED THE
ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT CORRECT.

MARK A, Emmxm.\ﬂ-v_uo September 17, 2015

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE THIS DATE
WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE ABOVE
BIDS.

Chowl Aot o

Cheryl Godfrey September 17, 2015



