BID ABSTRACT

ALL BIDS REJECTED

Demopolis Energy Conservation Improvements
Demopolis, ALABAMA
IFB # AC-14-B-0018-S

10-Jul-14
General Contractor Base Bid Alternate #1 Alternate #2 Alternate #3 Alternate #4 Alternate #5
Adkins & Kimbrough $ 614,300.00 | $ 29,190.00 | $ 31,000.00 30,692.00 | $ 32,600.00 | $ 40,070.00
BCS, LLC NO BID
CRL-Lovelady Construction, LLC NO BID
Hale Building Company $ 559,300.00 | $ 35,600.00 | $ 33,000.00 27,400.00 | $ 36,200.00 | $ 42,400.00
KDM Service Corp NO BID
LANICO, Inc NO BID
RDT Enterprises, LLC $ 557,531.00 | $ 27,314.00 | $ 21,367.00 27,753.00 | $ 26,426.00 | $ 35,721.00

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED
AND READ ALL OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT |
HAVE VERIFIED THE ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT
CORRECT.
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ALL BIDS REJECTED

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE THIS DATE
WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE
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