BID ABSTRACT

ALL BIDS REJECTED

DRTS Administrative Building ADM01 Maintenance, Repair & Restoration

Decatur, ALABAMA
IFB # AC-14-B-0039-S

7-Aug-14
General Contractor Base Bid Bid Option #1 Bid Option #2 Deductive Alternate #1 Alternate #2 Alternate #3
Building Construction Associates 1,483,400.00 782,600.00 610,500.00 | $ (13,600.00) 47,300.00 | $ " 48,400.00
Carmon Construction 1,569,844.00 779,469.00 714,314.00 | $ (13,000.00) 50,949.00 | $ 54,656.00
Daikin Applied NO BID
Garber Construction Company, Inc. 1,429,500.00 814,000.00 670,000.00 | $ (44,500.00) 57,000.00 | $ 57,000.00
Hale Building Co., Inc. 1,829,000.00 901,500.00 623,200.00 | $ (12,000.00) 53,000.00 | $ 56,500.00
Joiner Construction NO BID
Mitchell Industrial Contractors 1,836,900.00 1,010,700.00 768,960.00 | ¢ (50,100.00) 6,200.00 | $ 62,000.00
Pettus Mechanical Services NO BID
Psalms Construction, Inc NO BID

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED AND READ
ALL OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT | HAVE VERIFIED THE
ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT CORRECT.
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ALL BIDS REJECTED

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE THIS DATE
WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE ABOVE
BIDS

U Aoty

Cheryl Oom_ﬁmm >cmmmw 7,201%



