BID ABSTRACT

Montgomery, ALABAMA
IFB # AC-14-B-0086-S

Montgomery (Taylor Hardin) HVAC Upgrades

18-Sep-14
General Contractor Base Bid Alternate #1 Alternate #2 Alternate #3 Alternate #4 Alternate #5
A G. Dre Co 746,237.00 18,346.00 30,132.00 17,801.00 23,861.00 | $ 20,357.00
A. G. Gaston Construction NO BID
AMCO, Inc. NO BID
Amity Construction 619,880.00 17,800.00 23,200.00 13,500.00 15,980.00 | $ 13,900.00
Hale Building Company 688,940.00 23,131.00 36,256.00 25,657.00 32,054.00 | $ 23,260.00
Hollon Contracting, LLC NO BID
Hutcheson Construction Company, Inc. 618,700.00 16,300.00 22,700.00 11,330.00 16,300.00 | $ 11,500.00
Liberty Design & Construction NO BID
RDT Enterprises, LLC 597,261.00 15,786.00 27,240.00 20,060.00 22,849.00 | $ 20,075.00
TDR Construction Co., Inc NO BID

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED AND READ
ALL OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT | HAVE VERIFIED THE

ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT CORRECT.

MARK A. WEEKS, SPDO September 18, 2014

Chord

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE THIS DATE
WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE
ABOVE BIDS.

Cheryl ma%mw. September 18, B4




