BID ABSTRACT

DRTS Administrative Building ADMO01 Maintenance, Repair & Restoration

Decatur, ALABAMA
IFB # AC-14-B-0110-S

25-Sep-14
General Contractor Bid Item A Bid Item B Alternate 1-B Bid Item C

A. G. Gaston NO BID
Building Construction Associates 1,100,000.00 887,300.00 47,700.00 150,000.00

lard-Cook, Inc NO BID
Carmon Construction 1,138,844.00 738,000.00 41,000.00 118,000.00
Garber Construction Company, Inc. 1,155,000.00 822,000.00 40,000.00 192,000.00
Hale Building Co., Inc. 1,599,800.00 1,010,000.00 85,600.00 49,000.00
Joiner Construction NO BID
Lee Builders, Inc. 1,282,635.00 887,635.00 40,674.00 115,899.00
Mitchell Industrial Contractors NO BID
Pettus Mechanical Services NO BID
Psalms Construction, Inc NQ BID
RDT Enterprises 1,727,500.00 807,500.00 67,600.00 492,100.00

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED
AND READ ALL OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT |
HAVE VERIFIED THE ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT
CORRECT.

September 25, 2014

Cheryl Godfrey

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE THIS DATE
WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE
ABOVE BIDS

September 25, 2014




