BID ABSTRACT
Gadsden (Martin Air Station) Building #2 Renovations

Gadsden, ALABAMA
IFB # AC-15-B-0015-S
30-Jul-15
General Contractor Base Bid Alternate #1 Alternate #2 Alternate #3 Alternate #4 Alternate #5 Alternate #6
A G Gaston NO BID
Allen Building Co 1,170,593.00 6,100.00 6,280.00 133,467.00 35,500.00 14,140.00 45,520.00
BCS, LLC NO BID
Boatner Construction Co. 1,352,000.00 8,312.00 4,300.00 131,250.00 34,230.00 13,625.00 30,725.00
Chase Building Group NO BID
Hale Building Company $ 1,236,663.00 9,686.00 9,687.00 135,657.00 38,807.00 19,098.00 43,256.00
Hudak Construction Co., Inc. $ 1,198,000.00 10,900.00 4,200.00 144,000.00 46,600.00 14,000.00 30,800.00
Kent Consolidated Construction, Inc. $ 1,222,800.00 2,782.00 7,796.00 135,223.00 38,773.00 15,048.00 41,621.00
Metro D Construction $ 1,119,818.00 20,866.00 7,609.00 99,939.00 19,583.00 30,760.00 31,692.00
Pettus Plumbing & Piping NO BID
Trawick Contractors, Inc. $ 1,229,103.00 8,932.00 6,882.00 59,351.00 17,149.00 23,511.00 38,408.00

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE THIS DATE
WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE
ABOVE BIDS
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Cheryl Godlrey Julyl30, 2015 C

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED
AND READ ALL OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT |
HAVE VERIFIED THE ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT
CORRECT

July 30, 2015



