BID ABSTRACT

Auburn Construct Metal Storage Building

Auburn, ALABAMA

IFB # AC-15-B-0018-S

20-Aug-15
General Contractor Base Bid Alternate #1
BCS, LLC 353,475.00 | $ 7,200.00
CAM Builders LLC 268,824.00 | $ 10,700.00
Hale Building Company, Inc. 336,101.00 | $ 8,206.00
Hurst Construction, LLC NO BID
J & L Contractors, Inc. 242,300.00 | $ 11,365.00
Jarrett Construction Company NO BID
Jordan Industrial Contracting, LLC NO BID
Provision Contracting Services LLC 341,880.00 | $ 7,604.61
W.W. Compton Contractor, LLC 307,500.00 | $ 7,000.00
Whatley Construction LLC 291,987.00 | $ 15,505.00
Witherington Construction Corporation NO BID
J.F. Morgan General Contractor, Inc. 389,096.00 | $ 28,000.00

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED AND READ ALL
OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT | HAVE VERIFIED THE
ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT CORRECT.
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MARK A. WEEKS, SPDO August 20, 2015

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE THIS DATE
WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE ABOVE
BIDS.
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Cheryl Godfrey %n:ﬂ 20, 9015



